
 
 
 
 
 
 

2020 Ride for Freedom Nationwide 
RELEASE FORM AND 

ASSUMPTION OF THE RISK AGREEMENT 
The undersigned (on my own behalf and on behalf of my heirs, personal representative, successors and 
assigns), for and in consideration of the opportunity to participate in a “Ride”, “Poker Run”, “Event”, 
“Field Meet”, and/or event sponsored by Rolling Thunder, Inc., Rolling Thunder, Inc. Indiana Chapter 1, 
their respective officers, directors, employees, and agents (“Released Parties”), and for other valuable 
consideration, the receipt and adequacy of which are acknowledged, hereby releases and forever 
discharges the above-named entities and individuals from any and all claims, demands, rights, and 
causes of action of any kind whatsoever, which I now have or later may have in any way resulting from, 
or arising out of or in connection with my participation in any said events. 
 
This Release extends to any and all claims I have or may have against the released parties, even if such 
claims result from product liability or negligence (except willful neglect) on the part of any or all of the 
released parties, with respect to the vehicles operated or the events or with respect to the conditions, 
qualifications, instructions, rules or procedures under which the events are conducted or from any other 
causes. I understand this to mean that I agree not to sue any or all of the released parties for any injuries 
resulting to myself or my property during or in connection with the said events. 
 
I am voluntarily participating in Rolling Thunder, Inc. Indiana Chapter 1 and I expressly agree to assume 
the entire risk of any accidents or personal injury, including death, which I might suffer as a result of my 
participation whether such risk results from negligence (except willful neglect) on the part of any or all 
of the released parties. 
 
I additionally state that I participate in these events knowing that weather conditions, road conditions, 
and other similar conditions, factors and circumstances associated with these events may vary which 
may give rise to any injuries I incur. 
 
By signing this release, I certify that I have read this Release and fully understand it and that I am not 
relying on any statements or representations of anyone released thereby.      
 

THIS IS A RELEASE – READ BEFORE SIGNING 

              Signature:  ______________________________________________________________ 
 
              Print Name:  ____________________________________________________________ 
 
              Address:  _______________________________________________________________ 
 
              City/State/Zip:  __________________________________________________________ 
 
              Email Address: ___________________________________________________________ 
 
              Date:  _________________________________________  
 

 


